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“The object of this book,” writes William C. Dowling in his preface, “is to make the key concepts of Paul
Ricoeur’s Time and Narrative available to readers who might have felt bewildered by the twists and turns of
its argument.” The sources of puzzlement are, he notes, many. For some, it is Ricoeur’s famously indirect
style of presentation, in which the polarities of argument and exegesis seem so often and so suddenly to have
reversed themselves. For others, it is the extraordinary intellectual range of Ricoeur’s argument, drawing on
traditions as distant from each other as Heideggerian existentialism, French structuralism, and Anglo-
American analytic philosophy. Yet beneath the labyrinthian surface of Ricoeur’s Temps et récit, Dowling
reveals a single extended argument that, though developed unsystematically, is meant to be understood in
systematic terms. Ricoeur on Time and Narrative presents that argument in clear and concise terms, in a way
that will be enlightening both to readers new to Ricoeur and those who may have felt themselves adrift in the
complexities of Temps et récit, Ricoeur’s last major philosophical work. Dowling divides his discussion into
six chapters, all closely involved with specific arguments in Temps et récit: on mimesis, time, narrativity,
semantics of action, poetics of history, and poetics of fiction. Additionally, Dowling provides a preface that
lays out the French intellectual context of Ricoeur's philosophical method. An appendix presents his English
translation of a personal interview in which Ricoeur, having completed Time and Narrative, looks back over
his long career as an internationally renowned philosopher. Ricoeur on Time and Narrative communicates to
readers the intellectual excitement of following Ricoeur’s dismantling of established theories and
arguments—Aristotle and Augustine and Husserl on time, Frye and Greimas on narrative structure, Arthur
Danto and Louis O. Mink on the nature of historical explanation—while coming to see how, under the
pressure of Ricoeur’s analysis, these ideas are reconstituted and revealed in a new set of relations to one
another.
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From reader reviews:

Noah Giles:

Do you one among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on
guys this kind of aren't like that. This Ricoeur on Time and Narrative: An Introduction to Temps et récit
book is readable by you who hate the straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for
enjoyable looking at experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you.
The writer of Ricoeur on Time and Narrative: An Introduction to Temps et récit content conveys objective
easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just
different as it. So , do you even now thinking Ricoeur on Time and Narrative: An Introduction to Temps et
récit is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Patrick Duenas:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only
find e-book that need more time to be go through. Ricoeur on Time and Narrative: An Introduction to Temps
et récit can be your answer mainly because it can be read by you who have those short extra time problems.

Travis Berry:

It is possible to spend your free time you just read this book this e-book. This Ricoeur on Time and
Narrative: An Introduction to Temps et récit is simple to create you can read it in the recreation area, in the
beach, train along with soon. If you did not get much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy
the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. So there
are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Edna Vachon:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen need book to know the change information of year for you to year. As we know
those books have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. Through the book Ricoeur on Time and Narrative: An Introduction to Temps et récit we can consider
more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? To get creative person must prefer to read a book.
Just simply choose the best book that suited with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at
this time book Ricoeur on Time and Narrative: An Introduction to Temps et récit. You can more attractive
than now.
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