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What do you get when you combine a rickety, old church van with bags of fast food, gallons of caffeine-
drenched soda, a few hundred miles over several hours, and adrenalized teenagers who can't stand still? A
longgggg trip! But don't fret. Let the Road Rules be your guide! The subtitle says it all: Hundreds of Ideas,
Games, and Devotions for Less-Annoying Youth Group Travel. Let's be honest. You didn't get into this
racket to drive kids all over creation in a rusty heap that was manufactured before you were born! You got
into this because you love kids--and you want them to know God loves them, too. But often you need to get
kids to destinations other than the youth room to do what you do best--which sometimes means carting kids
from the church parking lot to a concert, conference, or camp site. So why hassle with the small stuff? Road
Rules author Steve Case offers a ton of practical and hilariously presented ideas you can take with you on the
dusty trail. This lil' volume covers: The 'theology' of the road Scriptures you can apply while traveling
Prayers for the journey Staying healthy while road tripping Van etiquette and behavioral guidelines Hints
and tips Horror stories Road games Discussion questions ...and much more! Plus, Steve isn't the only one
offering road wisdom. He combed through hundreds of stories and ideas from other youth workers to
supplement his own, the chose the very best ideas, most insightful words, and the most incredible horror
stories you can imagine--all geared to arm you with piles of proven, (okay, we'll say it) road-tested principles
that'll make your next excursion not only survivable, not only less annoying, but maybe even...fun!
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From reader reviews:

Victoria Williams:

The book Road Rules make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your capable a lot
more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem with the
subject. If you can make examining a book Road Rules to be your habit, you can get a lot more advantages,
like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You can know everything if
you like open up and read a e-book Road Rules. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or
encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Saul Robinson:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading routine give you
lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want send more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want feel happy read one
together with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Often the Road Rules is kind of e-book
which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Ruth McMillian:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their own reader with their story
as well as their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the guides. But also they write about the
ability about something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young
ones, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to improve their
proficiency in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write for their book. One of them is
this Road Rules.

Jerry Lyon:

You could spend your free time you just read this book this e-book. This Road Rules is simple to develop
you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not have much space to bring the
particular printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save
often the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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