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From August 10 to August 15, 1998, an international Advanced Research Workshop-Lecture Course on The
chloroplast: from Molecular Biology to Biotechnology was held at the Orthodox Academy of Crete,
Kolymbari-Chania, on the island of Crete, Greece. After five previous meetings on the chloroplast topic in
Marburg (1975), Spetses (1978), Rhodos (1985), Aghia Pelaghia, Crete (1991) and Marburg (1995) this
conference proved again that chloroplast research is continuously in the focus of intensive research interest.
The meeting, sponsored by NATO and supported by the Federation of the European Societies for Plant
Physiology (FESPP) and the Greek Ministry of Development (General Secretariat of Research and
Development), was held under the auspices of the International Society for Chloroplast Development and the
National Center for Scientific Research "Demokritos", Athens-Greece. Aim of the workshop was to bring
together experts and students from different disciplines, coming from various countries around the world,
studying chloroplast biogenesis from different perspectives in an effort to propose biotechnological
approaches, via genetic manipulation of the organelle, applicable in solving problems of economic
importance. Ninety scientists (including observers) coming from 19 countries actively participated and
discussed recent advances in the field. During the meeting it became clear that as a result of the progress
made in molecular biology, including genomic sequence, and in biochemistry over recent years, this exciting
field of chloroplast development is continuously promoted by renewed interest in as yet unsolved but very
important questions.
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Vasquez:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading
habit give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside
the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of reserve
you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want really feel happy
read one having theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Typically the The Chloroplast: From
Molecular Biology to Biotechnology (Nato Science Partnership Subseries: 3) is kind of guide which is giving
the reader unstable experience.

Joyce Jacobs:

The guide with title The Chloroplast: From Molecular Biology to Biotechnology (Nato Science Partnership
Subseries: 3) has lot of information that you can study it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This
specific book exist new expertise the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the
world right now. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This particular book
will bring you with new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can
read this anywhere you want.

Sarah Porter:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book
compared to can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need
more time to be go through. The Chloroplast: From Molecular Biology to Biotechnology (Nato Science
Partnership Subseries: 3) can be your answer mainly because it can be read by anyone who have those short
spare time problems.

Mildred Vang:

You are able to spend your free time to learn this book this reserve. This The Chloroplast: From Molecular
Biology to Biotechnology (Nato Science Partnership Subseries: 3) is simple bringing you can read it in the
playground, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not get much space to bring typically the printed
book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the book in your
smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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