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Il commissario Fontanelli, l’avvocato Zambrotta e il boss mafioso Rodolfo Alfieri, sono i protagonisti di
quest’accattivante e intrigato romanzo ambientato in particolar modo, tra la Sicilia e la Capitale. Il prode
commissario con astuzia e determinazione riesce a intrufolarsi sotto mentite spoglie, negli ambienti siciliani
di “cosa nostra”, ma a causa di una sua leggerezza, ben presto fu scoperta la sua vera identità. Da quel
momento la vita del commissario e della sua famiglia, divenne davvero difficile. L’avvocato Zambrotta era
un killer al servizio della mafia, che utilizzava la sua professione di avvocato come copertura, un
collaboratore esterno della criminosa associazione che ammazzava su commissione e intascava la cospicua
paga. Come se non bastasse, l’avvocato Zambrotta era uno dei migliori amici del commissario.
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From reader reviews:

Patrick Reyes:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even knowledge to
make all of them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming to you
actually is you don't know which you should start with. This Il Commissario Fontanelli (Italian Edition) is
our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and need
in this era.

Robert Garcia:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic
inside park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different
to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book may be option to fill your free of charge
time/ holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to try
out look for book, may be the reserve untitled Il Commissario Fontanelli (Italian Edition) can be good book
to read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Cinthia Jacobsen:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or just
lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Il Commissario Fontanelli (Italian Edition) can be the
reply, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your time by reading in this
completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

Corey Cook:

In this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you
need to do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of
several books in the top checklist in your reading list is definitely Il Commissario Fontanelli (Italian Edition).
This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By
looking upwards and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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