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Two agents' forgotten love is rekindled in USA TODAY bestselling author Debra Webb's Colby Agency:
The Specialists series. 

Someone was out to get Thomas Casey. His profession had taught him to trust no one. So when Johara di
Rossi abducted him on his way to his beloved niece's wedding, Thomas assumed the worst—despite their
intimate history.  

Though attachments made him vulnerable, Thomas was haunted by regret for walking away from Jo years
ago. No other woman had stirred such intense desire in him. Now, snowbound in an isolated cabin, with a
determined enemy from his past closing in, suspicion begins to melt away as the embers of their passion
reignite.
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From reader reviews:

Elizabeth Brock:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not require people to be aware of each data they get. How individuals to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information especially this Bridal Armor (The Colby Agency
Book 51) book because book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book
hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Diego Mears:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With looking at you can
get a lot of information which will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their reader with their story as
well as their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the books. But also they write about advantage
about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids,
there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their skill in
writing, they also doing some investigation before they write on their book. One of them is this Bridal Armor
(The Colby Agency Book 51).

Susan Preuss:

Exactly why? Because this Bridal Armor (The Colby Agency Book 51) is an unordinary book that the inside
of the reserve waiting for you to snap it but latter it will jolt you with the secret it inside. Reading this book
next to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such incredible way makes the content within
easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you
for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of
gains than the other book have such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking approach. So
, still want to postpone having that book? If I had been you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Catherine Hershey:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try factor that really opposite from
that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Bridal Armor (The Colby Agency
Book 51), you are able to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of
hang-out type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its known as
reading friends.
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