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Deploy Microsoft Virtualization and VDI solutions using real-world Hyper-V configurations

About This Book

Get acquainted with the basics of Windows Server Hyper-V 2012 R2 and understand how to efficiently●

design a highly available virtualization solution
Assess your physical server environment and understand the fundamentals of server consolidation and●

sizing of Hyper-V hosts
Design practical solutions for common design patterns with explanations of these design decisions●

Who This Book Is For

This book is aimed at IT admins, consultants, and architects alike who wish to deploy, manage, and maintain
Hyper-V solutions in organizations of various sizes. Readers are expected to have a working knowledge of
managing Windows Servers and a fair understanding of networking and storage concepts.

What You Will Learn

Set up independent and highly available clustered Hyper-V hosts via GUI and PowerShell●

Acquire knowledge about Generation 1 and 2 Virtual Machines, their creation and management, and also●

look at the VM Conversion process
Understand NIC Teaming, Extensible Virtual Switch, and other networking advancements●

Gain insight into virtual machine storage changes and its follow-up benefits●

Discover backup and recovery patterns for Hyper-V●

Familiarize yourself with the essentials of Hyper-V Replica●

Leverage the benefits of Microsoft VDI●

In Detail

The IT community has already experienced the benefits of server virtualization. However, they were limited
to one option primarily until Microsoft released its flagship Hypervisor platform. Windows Server Hyper-V
2012 and R2 along with Hyper-V Server 2012 and R2 present a cost effective yet robust virtualization
solution to enterprises who wish to consolidate their physical server workloads or migrate their pre-existing
VMware workloads to Hyper-V. Hyper-V has proven to be a stable and an economical virtualization solution
and with its high availability, live migration, and new network virtualization and storage enhancement
features, enterprises will never feel the need to consider another alternative.

This book is a practical, example-oriented tutorial that will guide you through the basics and architecture of
the Hyper-V platform and thereafter help you understand how to build your Virtualization infrastructure
from the ground up.

The book then goes on to focus on scalability and high availability aspects and trains you in setting up highly



available Hyper-V clusters and the live migration of virtual machines. You will also learn about the
advancements in virtual networking and storage in Windows Server 2012.

After the implementation guidance, the book then advises you on how to set up backup and recovery and
how to prepare a disaster recovery plan via Hyper-V Replica.

The book concludes with a good insight into Microsoft VDI implementation guidance.

Style and approach

This is a handy and easy-to-follow guide that describes virtualization concepts and the Hyper-V design
approach. Each topic is explained sequentially and is enhanced with real-world scenarios, practical
examples, screenshots, and step-by-step explanations to help readers understand clearly.
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From reader reviews:

Gina Hill:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading
book thus. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
info. When you read a reserve you will get new information because book is one of a number of ways to
share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, examining a book will make anyone more imaginative.
When you examining a book especially fictional book the author will bring someone to imagine the story
how the characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other people. When you
read this Designing Hyper-V Solutions, it is possible to tells your family, friends along with soon about
yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a reserve.

Danilo Ernest:

The guide untitled Designing Hyper-V Solutions is the publication that recommended to you to see. You can
see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to a person. The language that author use to
explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of study when write the book, hence
the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of
Designing Hyper-V Solutions from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Crystal Lavigne:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or go to the outside with them loved ones or their
friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or playing video games
all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can read a book. It is
really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent the whole day to reading a
book. The book Designing Hyper-V Solutions it is very good to read. There are a lot of folks that
recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough
space bringing this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this book out of your smart
phone. The price is not too costly but this book provides high quality.

Vickie Duke:

Reading a book being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to examine a book. When you
examine a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts
of book that you have read. In order to get information about your review, you can read education books, but
if you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, along with
soon. The Designing Hyper-V Solutions provide you with new experience in looking at a book.
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