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Using game thinking and game mechanics in non-game settings to promote engagement and learning is a
new trend in both business and education sectors. Savvy marketers are gamifying their efforts by offering
customers loyalty badges, check-in incentives, and achievement rewards and clever employers are leveraging
this new trend to gamify their training and innovation processes. Discover how you can use game design
techniques to involve patrons and motivate staff in your library. This primer will walk you through
incorporating game thinking into bibliographic instruction, staff training, the online catalog, and more. Learn
how to gamify the library experience.

This A–Z guidebook covers a range of exciting ways to use gamification in your library. Readers will learn
the ins and outs of gamification techniques through projects, such as:

badge hunts for staff orientation;●

a “face of the library” game for patron services;●

badges for your programs;●

augmented reality and a catalog Easter egg hunt;●

interactive fiction for information literacy education; and●

top-down video games for library orientation.●
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From reader reviews:

Catherine Gabel:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With examining you can get a
lot of information that could give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world could share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their reader with their story as
well as their experience. Not only situation that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the knowledge
about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your children,
there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their ability
in writing, they also doing some study before they write to the book. One of them is this Game It Up!: Using
Gamification to Incentivize Your Library (Library Technology Essentials).

Reginald Hunter:

The guide with title Game It Up!: Using Gamification to Incentivize Your Library (Library Technology
Essentials) includes a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this
book. That book exist new know-how the information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the
world at this point. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This
particular book will bring you in new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book in your smart phone,
so you can read it anywhere you want.

Kirby Paradiso:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not attempting Game It Up!: Using
Gamification to Incentivize Your Library (Library Technology Essentials) that give your enjoyment
preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as
the means for people to know world considerably better then how they react to the world. It can't be said
constantly that reading habit only for the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to possibly be
success person. So , for every you who want to start reading through as your good habit, you may pick Game
It Up!: Using Gamification to Incentivize Your Library (Library Technology Essentials) become your own
starter.

Kerry Maye:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind skill or
thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book in comparison with can
satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be
read. Game It Up!: Using Gamification to Incentivize Your Library (Library Technology Essentials) can be
your answer because it can be read by a person who have those short time problems.
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