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Within anthropology, as elsewhere in the human sciences, there is a tendency to divide knowledge making
into two separate poles: conceptual (theory) vs. empirical (ethnography). In Theory Can Be More than It
Used to Be, Dominic Boyer, James D. Faubion, and George E. Marcus argue that we need to take a step back
from the assumption that we know what theory is to investigate how theory—a matter of concepts, of
analytic practice, of medium of value, of professional ideology—operates in anthropology and related fields
today. They have assembled a distinguished group of scholars to diagnose the state of the theory-
ethnography divide in anthropology today and to explore alternative modes of analytical and pedagogical
practice.

Continuing the methodological insights provided in Fieldwork Is Not What It Used to Be, the contributors to
this volume find that now is an optimal time to reflect on the status of theory in relation to ethnographic
research in anthropology and kindred disciplines. Together they engage with questions such as, What passes
for theory in anthropology and the human sciences today and why? What is theory's relation to ethnography?
How are students trained to identify and respect anthropological theorization and how do they practice
theoretical work in their later career stages? What theoretical experiments, languages, and institutions are
available to the human sciences? Throughout, the editors and authors consider theory in practical terms,
rather than as an amorphous set of ideas, an esoteric discourse of power, a norm of intellectual life, or an
infinitely contestable canon of texts. A short editorial afterword explores alternative ethics and institutions of
pedagogy and training in theory.

Contributors: Andrea Ballestero, Rice University; Dominic Boyer, Rice University; Lisa Breglia, George
Mason University; Jessica Marie Falcone, Kansas State University; James D. Faubion, Rice University; Kim
Fortun, Rensselaer Polytechnic Institute; Andreas Glaeser, University of Chicago; Cymene Howe, Rice
University; Jamer Hunt, Parsons The New School for Design and the Institute of Design in Umea, Sweden;
George E. Marcus, University of California, Irvine; Townsend Middleton, University of North Carolina at
Chapel Hill; Deepa S. Reddy, University of Houston–Clear Lake; Kaushik Sunder Rajan, University of
Chicago
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From reader reviews:

Brad Bennett:

Book is definitely written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can learn everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important matter to bring us around the world. Beside that
you can your reading talent was fluently. A book Theory Can Be More than It Used to Be: Learning
Anthropology's Method in a Time of Transition will make you to become smarter. You can feel more
confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think in which open or reading a new
book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you trying to find best
book or appropriate book with you?

Alice Black:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy individual? If
you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have extra
time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They should answer that question simply
because just their can do that. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is right.
Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this Theory Can Be More than It Used to Be:
Learning Anthropology's Method in a Time of Transition to read.

Lorraine Cox:

This Theory Can Be More than It Used to Be: Learning Anthropology's Method in a Time of Transition book
is simply not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading
this book is information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting
deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This Theory Can Be More than It Used to Be: Learning
Anthropology's Method in a Time of Transition without we know teach the one who studying it become
critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Theory Can Be More than It Used to Be:
Learning Anthropology's Method in a Time of Transition can bring once you are and not make your handbag
space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even phone. This
Theory Can Be More than It Used to Be: Learning Anthropology's Method in a Time of Transition having
fine arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Phillip Chadwick:

This Theory Can Be More than It Used to Be: Learning Anthropology's Method in a Time of Transition is
brand new way for you who has intense curiosity to look for some information given it relief your hunger
associated with. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still
having little digest in reading this Theory Can Be More than It Used to Be: Learning Anthropology's Method
in a Time of Transition can be the light food for yourself because the information inside this kind of book is



easy to get by simply anyone. These books develop itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, sure I
mean in the e-book application form. People who think that in guide form make them feel drowsy even dizzy
this book is the answer. So there is no in reading a publication especially this one. You can find actually
looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book sort for your better
life as well as knowledge.
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