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There is no greater British icon from the 'Swinging Sixties' than the marvelous Mini. All of the most famous
faces of the decade, from the Beatles (all of whom owned at least one Mini) and Twiggy to Steve McQueen
and various members of the Royal family owned a Mini. The Mini, in fact, became a firm favorite in society
circles when the Queen was photographed driving one. Sixties icon it may have been, but the Mini was, in
fact, born in the Fifties. The car was officially launched in August 1959 and cost just GBP 497, making this
innovative design the cheapest new car you could buy. In no time at all it was proving its worth on the race
track, winning its class at Snetterton the first time it was entered in competition. In 1964, it won the
prestigious Monte Carlo Rally, the first of three such wins, beating off determined competition from Renault,
Citroen and even the illustrious Mercedes and Porsche! It was, however, as a practical, economical road car
that the Mini really made its mark and it is the legions of fans who have driven and owned the car over the
years who will love the tidbits of information and nostalgic stories that are packed into this book as tightly as
the 21 Malaysian students who squeezed themselves into a Mini to claim the world record in 2006!
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From reader reviews:

Gracie Davis:

The book The Mini Miscellany make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You need to use to make your
capable more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem
using your subject. If you can make studying a book The Mini Miscellany to get your habit, you can get
much more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about many or all
subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like available and read a reserve The Mini Miscellany.
Kinds of book are several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you
think about this publication?

Katherine Levy:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information these days can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a knowledge or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider any
time those information which is within the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking seriously
which one is appropriate to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you obtain the
unstable resource then you have it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take The Mini Miscellany as your daily resource
information.

Ethel Davidson:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspaper,
book, and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book
that recommended to your account is The Mini Miscellany this reserve consist a lot of the information on the
condition of this world now. This book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The terminology
styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some research when he
makes this book. Here is why this book suited all of you.

Timmy Gallegos:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book The Mini Miscellany was colourful and of course
has pictures on the website. As we know that book The Mini Miscellany has many kinds or type. Start from
kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and think you are
the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and
chill out. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like reading this.
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