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Back in the hands of the State, Thalli is caught in a horrible game of power—with consequences
reaching further than she ever imagined.

After several months aboveground, Thalli had almost forgotten what living in the State was like.
Programmed to be without emotions or curiosity, she was always an anomaly there. Too emotional. Too
curious. Citizens of the State should behave exactly the way the Scientists designed them to behave: work in
their assigned fields, maintain productivity.

Thalli’s entire genetically engineered generation has been eradicated by a scientocracy that believes human
life is expendable. Now a pawn in a mad game of manipulation, held hostage, and tortured in the name of the
State, Thalli can barely summon the strength to hope that the future of humanity could be any better.

She clings to her new faith in the Designer. But when she discovers that even the few villages aboveground
are in danger of State domination, that fragile faith begins to crumble.

As Thalli, Berk, and Alex make plans to overthrow the evil Dr. Loudin, a chilling secret explains why they
have been left alive at all . . . a personal secret that will haunt Thalli forever. And as she struggles with this
new truth, she also struggles with decisions of the heart.

Can the State’s expansion be stopped? Or will humanity—above and below the surface—be irreparably
damaged? Thalli is faced with a purpose both overwhelming and undeniable: to assume the role of a
Revolutionary.

“McGee's versatility as an author really shines with this latest offering . . .” —USAToday.com (on Anomaly)

“Anomaly grabs the reader and refuses to let go . . . One is never completely sure what is fact and what is a
horrifying virtual reality. This is sure to be a favorite of teens everywhere.” —Heather Burch, author of the
critically acclaimed Halflings Series
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From reader reviews:

Mary Edick:

This Revolutionary (Anomaly) book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The
benefit you have by reading this book is definitely information inside this publication incredible fresh, you
will get facts which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This particular
Revolutionary (Anomaly) without we realize teach the one who reading it become critical in imagining and
analyzing. Don't become worry Revolutionary (Anomaly) can bring whenever you are and not make your
bag space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even cell phone. This
Revolutionary (Anomaly) having very good arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not really
feel uninterested in reading.

Richard Hund:

Revolutionary (Anomaly) can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. We recommend that straight
away because this book has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand,
bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to set every word into
enjoyment arrangement in writing Revolutionary (Anomaly) however doesn't forget the main place, giving
the reader the hottest and based confirm resource information that maybe you can be one of it. This great
information can drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial thinking.

Vera Pinckney:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can satisfy
your short period of time to read it because this all time you only find publication that need more time to be
study. Revolutionary (Anomaly) can be your answer given it can be read by you actually who have those
short time problems.

Oscar Jackson:

As a college student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library
or to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's soul or real
their interest. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on
this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this Revolutionary (Anomaly) can make you feel more interested to read.
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