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The Path of the Devil is organized around three fundamental theories: witch hunts as functional sacrificial
ceremonies, realistic conflict and strategic persecution, and scapegoat phenomena. All conjectures point to
the role of epidemic disease, war, and climactic and economic hardships as considerable factors. However,
such crises have to be differentiated: when war is measured as a quantitative characteristic it is found to
inhibit witch hunts, while epidemic disease and economic hardship encourages them. The book integrates the
sociologies of collective behavior, contentious conflict, and deviance with cross-disciplinary theory and
research. The final chapters examine the Salem witch trials as 'a perfect storm,' and illustrate the general
patterns found for early modern witch hunts and 'modern witch hunts,' which exhibit similarities that are
found to be more than metaphorical.
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From reader reviews:

Gloria Pruitt:

The book The Path of the Devil: Early Modern Witch Hunts will bring you to the new experience of reading
a book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book you just read, this
book very ideal to you. The book The Path of the Devil: Early Modern Witch Hunts is much recommended
to you to see. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Mary Killgore:

Typically the book The Path of the Devil: Early Modern Witch Hunts has a lot associated with on it. So
when you check out this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was written by the very famous author.
The author makes some research previous to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you will get
the point easily after looking over this book.

Richard Daniels:

Reading a book to be new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to study a book. When you study a
book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, because book
has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book that you have
read. If you wish to get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but if you want to
entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The The
Path of the Devil: Early Modern Witch Hunts will give you a new experience in examining a book.

Santiago Johnson:

You can find this The Path of the Devil: Early Modern Witch Hunts by check out the bookstore or Mall. Just
viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of
this e-book are various. Not only by simply written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book simply
by e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your
problem. Right now, choose your own personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most
important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose appropriate ways
for you.
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