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Demystifying Meaningful Coincidences (Synchronicities): The Evolving Self, the Personal Unconscious, and
the Creative Process offers an original theory of the nature of meaningful coincidences (synchronicities) and
their practical use from a naturalistic (nonsupernatural and non-Jungian) perspective. The findings are the
outgrowth of Gibbs A. Williams's forty-year investigation, both as a professional observer of some of his
synchronicity prone patients receiving psychoanalytic psychotherapy as well as of his own intimate
experience of these intellectually challenging and emotionally powerful occurrences. His naturalistic
perspective is in marked contrast to the findings of Jung and his followers, who view these odd events as
"channeled" messages from a transcendent realm of spiritual reality. Instead, Williams concludes that
meaningful coincidences are the surface manifestations of an individual's unique creative process,
accommodating the "best" available resolution of a problem for a person initially feeling "stuck" in a
seemingly intractable dilemma.

While his analysis robs the magic associated with only reacting to the "numinous uncanny aura" associated
with synchronicities, it nevertheless affirms a wondrous appreciation for the creative capacities of each
person to order his or her own chaos. Readers are treated to a rich mine of historical data, novel concepts,
and theoretical insights drawn from speculative philosophy, depth psychology, and esoteric occult and
spiritual traditions, and they are shown how to decode their own synchronicities in order to be able to use
their embedded "messages" for increased self-awareness, cohesiveness, and expanding consciousness.
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From reader reviews:

Ashley Parra:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the publication entitled Demystifying Meaningful Coincidences (Synchronicities): The
Evolving Self, the Personal Unconscious, and the Creative Process. Try to face the book Demystifying
Meaningful Coincidences (Synchronicities): The Evolving Self, the Personal Unconscious, and the Creative
Process as your buddy. It means that it can to become your friend when you really feel alone and beside that
of course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes
you considerably more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , let me make new
experience and knowledge with this book.

John Jonas:

This Demystifying Meaningful Coincidences (Synchronicities): The Evolving Self, the Personal
Unconscious, and the Creative Process usually are reliable for you who want to be described as a successful
person, why. The main reason of this Demystifying Meaningful Coincidences (Synchronicities): The
Evolving Self, the Personal Unconscious, and the Creative Process can be one of the great books you must
have is definitely giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed an individual with information
that perhaps will shock your prior knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it just about
everywhere and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed people. Beside that this Demystifying
Meaningful Coincidences (Synchronicities): The Evolving Self, the Personal Unconscious, and the Creative
Process forcing you to have an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical
thinking that we all know it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Charles Baker:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book mainly book entitled
Demystifying Meaningful Coincidences (Synchronicities): The Evolving Self, the Personal Unconscious,
and the Creative Process the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each and every
aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a
e-book then become one web form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get prior to. The
Demystifying Meaningful Coincidences (Synchronicities): The Evolving Self, the Personal Unconscious,
and the Creative Process giving you another experience more than blown away your brain but also giving
you useful facts for your better life in this era. So now let us explain to you the relaxing pattern is your body
and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished reading through it, like winning a casino game. Do
you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?



Charles Simpson:

You may spend your free time to study this book this book. This Demystifying Meaningful Coincidences
(Synchronicities): The Evolving Self, the Personal Unconscious, and the Creative Process is simple to bring
you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not possess much space to
bring the actual printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save
often the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this
book.
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