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Beautifully blending contemporary travel writing and military history, John Gimlette travels across Europe
in the footsteps of one of the greatest armies ever assembled: the United States forces of 1944-45. In 2004,
John Gimlette set off across Europe with his guide Putnam Flint, an eighty-six-year-old Bostonian who had
landed in Marseille in the midst of World War II with his tank destroyer battalion, nicknamed The Panthers.
With Flint's help, Gimlette traveled from Marseille north to Dijon and Alsace, Paris and Lorraine, across the
Rhine into Germany, and eventually south through the Alps into Austria. Gimlette provides a vivid portrait
of the route as it is today, from spectacular landscapes to cities that have risen from cinders and as it was
during one of the most tumultuous moments in world history.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Martina White:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite e-book and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the reserve entitled Panther Soup: Travels Through Europe in War and Peace. Try to make the
book Panther Soup: Travels Through Europe in War and Peace as your buddy. It means that it can to be your
friend when you feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very
fortuned for you personally. The book makes you more confidence because you can know anything by the
book. So , we should make new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Charles Smith:

Here thing why this particular Panther Soup: Travels Through Europe in War and Peace are different and
trusted to be yours. First of all reading through a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content than it
which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Panther Soup: Travels Through Europe in War and Peace
giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any book out there but there is no e-book
that similar with Panther Soup: Travels Through Europe in War and Peace. It gives you thrill reading
journey, its open up your eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is probably can be happened
around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your way home by train. If you
are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Panther Soup: Travels Through
Europe in War and Peace in e-book can be your alternate.

William Stone:

Is it a person who having spare time and then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Panther Soup: Travels Through Europe in
War and Peace can be the reply, oh how comes? A book you know. You are and so out of date, spending
your extra time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the
others?

Nicole Floyd:

E-book is one of source of know-how. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen require book to know the update information of year to be able to year. As we
know those guides have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around
the world. Through the book Panther Soup: Travels Through Europe in War and Peace we can take more
advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To get creative person must prefer to read a book. Simply
choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this book
Panther Soup: Travels Through Europe in War and Peace. You can more inviting than now.
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