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The systematic review of quantum genetics based on the theory on non-Abelian gauge fields is represented
in this book. The concept of fundamental conception of atom's protonic charge is also included. Description
of the biological processes is conducted in a six-dimensional space with metric tensor 4+ 2-. The properties
of main biological structures DNA, RNA and proteins are discussed on the basis of equivalent charge
configuration of amino acids of the genetic code. It is proved that the conformal field of amino acids is equal
to quantizied gravitational field with a spin of 5/2. This book is intended for specialists in theoretical biology,
quantum theory of field, molecular biology and genetics.
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From reader reviews:

Kathleen Allen:

Do you considered one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on
guys that aren't like that. This Quantum Genetics book is readable by you who hate the perfect word style.
You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving possibly
decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer regarding Quantum Genetics content
conveys the thought easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
articles but it just different such as it. So , do you even now thinking Quantum Genetics is not loveable to be
your top list reading book?

Patricia Gross:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even restricted. What people must be consider
any time those information which is in the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking seriously
which one is acceptable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable
resource then you buy it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen with you if you take Quantum Genetics as your daily resource information.

Willette Bickel:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you
examine a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
due to the fact book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, as well as soon.
The Quantum Genetics provide you with a new experience in studying a book.

Teresa Ealy:

You can obtain this Quantum Genetics by browse the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it
could to be your solve problem if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this publication are
various. Not only through written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In
the modern era just like now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what their problem.
Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to
arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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